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General Information 

**Deadline for articles to be 

submitted for the Newsletter 

is the 20th of each month. 

Editor:  Jennifer Whitehead 
 
Phone: (620) 367-8111 

E-Mail: goescity@mtelco.net 

Web: www.goesselks.com 

Library Hours 

Monday 4:00-8:00 pm 

Tuesday 5:00-7:00 pm 

Thursday 9:00 am-1 pm 

Friday 9:00 am-2 pm 

Saturday 9:00 am-12 pm 

 

Librarian—Laura Dailey 

Phone:  (620) 367-8440 

E-Mail: goeslib@mtelco.net 

Inside this Issue: 

Weather Lab  2 

Garden Club   2 

Community Calendar 3 

 

 

 

 

Please consider receiving 
the newsletter via email.  
Contact us at 
goescity@mtelco.net 

 
www.facebook.com/goessel.kansas 

Water/Sewer Rate Increase 

(1)  For each 3/4 inch water meter, a minimum charge of $12.25 per month for which the customer is entitled to 
1,000 gallons of water.  The customer shall pay $4.42 for each additional 1,000 gallons of water used, up to a 
total of 5,000 gallons; and for each 1,000 gallons thereafter there shall be a charge of $4.77. 

(2)  For each 1 inch water meter, a minimum charge of $32.03 per month for which the customer is entitled to 
5,000 gallons of water.  The customer shall pay $4.42 for each additional 1,000 gallons of water used, up to a 
total of 7,500 gallons; and for each 1,000 gallons thereafter there shall be a charge of $4.77. 

(3)  For each 1 ½ inch water meter and 2 inch meter, a minimum charge of $50.42 per month for which the cus-
tomer is entitled to 7,500 gallons of water.  The customer shall pay $4.42 for each additional 1,000 gallons of 
water used, up to a total of 15,000 gallons; and for each 1,000 gallons thereafter there shall be a charge of 
$4.77. 

(4)  For each 4 inch water meter, a minimum charge of $79.22 per month for which the customer is entitled to 
20,000 gallons of water.  The customer shall pay $4.42 for each additional 1,000 gallons of water used, up to a 
total of 40,000 gallons; and for each 1,000 gallons thereafter there shall be a charge of $4.77. 

Monthly charges for water use by users who are not residents of the City of Goessel shall be based upon the 
size of water meter installed and amount of water used, and shall be charged a sum equal to twice the charge 
assessed to a resident of the City of Goessel. 

In addition to the charges for water established above in parts, there shall be a surcharge for the purpose of 
servicing and improvements to the municipal water system and to provide for maintenance and upkeep thereon, 
based on the size of the water meter installed, which shall be billed and shall be payable at the same time as the 
regular water bill is due and payable as follows: 

  (a)  For each ¾ inch or 1 inch water meter, a charge of $8.00 per month. 

  (b)  For each 1 ½ inch or 2 inch water meter, a charge of $12.00 per month. 

  (c)  For each 4 inch water meter, a charge of $16.00 per month. 

 

(1) For all contributors, monthly user charges will be based on the average monthly water usage determined 
during the months of January, February and March, and each contributor’s average month water usage shall be 
established on the 1st day of May each year.  In the event a contributor has not established a January, February, 
March average, his or her monthly user charge shall be the average charge of all other residential contributors.  
In the event a contributor does not use city water, his or her monthly user charge shall also be the average 
charge of all other residential contributors. 

(2)  The minimum charge per month shall be $22.00.  In addition, each contributor that is located in the city shall 
pay a user charge rate for operation and maintenance, including replacement, of $.30 per 100 gallons of water 
(or wastewater) and each contributor that is not located in the city shall pay a user charge rate of $.40 per 100 
gallons of water (or wastewater), all as determined in paragraph (b) of this Section.  Further, every contributor 
shall pay a sewer maintenance examination fee of $2.00 per month for each meter used by such contributor. 
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PAGE  2 SMALL TOWN BIG HEART  VOLUME 14— I SSUE 1  

 
Town & Country  

Garden Club  
 

The Town & Country Garden Club will be meeting on 

January 23rd, at 7:00pm. The meeting will be held at 

the Goessel Community Room. Joanna Friesen will   

discuss the history of garden design. Everyone is wel-

come to attend.   

Call Luanne Soukup at 620-747-2618 for more infor-

mation. 

 



Sun Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat 

   1 2 3 4 

5 6 7 8 9 10 11 

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 

19 20 21 22 23 24 25 

26 27 28 29 30 31  
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City Office & 

Shop Closed  

HS Boys BB @ 

Burrton 6 PM 

PTO Meeting   

6:45 PM 

HS Boys BB @ 

Burrton 6:00 

PM 

HS Boys BB @ 

Burrton 3 PM 

JH BB @ Elyria  

3 PM 

JH BB vs. 

Moundridge 4:30 PM 

HS Boys JV BB @ 

Goessel 5:30PM 

HS Girls BB @   

Fairfield 6PM 

HS Girls BB @ 

Fairfield 6PM 

HS Girls BB 

vs. 

Moundridge    

6 PM 

HS Boys BB @ 

Burrton 3 PM 

HS BB @   

Canton-Galva 

4:30 PM 

JH BB @    

Inman 4:00 

PM 

City Council 

Meeting 6PM 

JH BB C-Trny   

@ Goessel 9:00 

AM 

JH BB @    

Wakefield 5:15 

PM 

HS BB @     

Solomon 4:30 

PM 

HS BB vs.   

Rural Vista 

4:30 PM 

Girls HS JV BB 

@ Hope       

10:00 AM 

 

JH BB vs.    

Little River    

4:30PM 

HS BB vs.    

Wakefield      

4:30 PM 

January 2020 

JH BB vs. Solo-

mon 4:30 PM 

HS Girls BB @ 

Fairfield 6PM 

HS Boys BB vs. 

Moundridge 

6PM 

HS Girls BB @ 

Fairfield 6PM 


